

Mayor
John J. Lee

City Manager
Dr. Qiong X. Liu, P.E., PTOE

Council Members
Scott Black
Pamela A. Goynes-Brown
Isaac E. Barron
Richard J. Cherchio



Finance Department

2250 Las Vegas Boulevard, North · Suite 710 · North Las Vegas, Nevada 89030
Telephone: (702) 633-1906 · TDD: (800) 326-6868
www.cityofnorthlasvegas.com

November 8, 2017

CITY OF NORTH LAS VEGAS BID B-1527 HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD

This Bid is being awarded by Line Items. The following companies are recommended for Award of this Bid; Coastline Equipment, Ecco Equipment, United Rentals, HercRentals, Ahern Rentals and Cashman Rentals.. Respondents have five (5) business days from the date of this notification to submit a protest. Any protest submitted on this recommendation of award must be received in the Office of the City Clerk, 2250 Las Vegas Boulevard, Suite 800, North Las Vegas, NV 89030, no later than November 15, 2017, 12:00 p.m., Pacific Time and be in accordance with the following protest procedure:

BID PROTESTS: The City will publish the Recommendation of Award Notification on the City of North Las Vegas' website (www.cityofnorthlasvegas.com). Any Respondent may file a notice of protest regarding the proposed award of a contract by the North Las Vegas City Council. *Respondents will have five (5) business days from the date the Recommendation of Award is published to submit the written protest to the City Clerk.* The written protest must include a statement setting forth, with specificity, the reasons the person filing the protest believes that applicable provisions of the contract documents or law were violated. At the time a notice of protest is filed, the person filing such notice of protest shall post a bond with a good and solvent surety authorized to do business in the State of Nevada, and supply it to the City Clerk. *The bond posted must be in an amount equal to the lesser of: twenty-five (25) percent of the total value of the bid submitted by the person filing the notice of protest; or two hundred fifty thousand dollars (\$250,000).*

A notice of protest filed in accordance with this section shall operate as a stay of action in relation to the award of the contract until a determination is made by the North Las Vegas City Council. A person who makes an unsuccessful bid may not seek any type of judicial intervention until after the North Las Vegas City Council has made a determination on the notice of protest and awarded the contract. Neither the City nor any authorized representative of the City is liable for any costs, expenses, attorney's fees, loss of income or other damages sustained by a person who submits a bid, whether or not the person files a notice of protest pursuant to this section.

If a protest is upheld, the bond posted and submitted with the notice of protest will be returned to the person who posted the bond. If the protest is rejected, a claim may be made against the bond by the City in an amount equal to the expenses incurred by the City because of the unsuccessful protest.


Paul Sikora
Contracts Coordinator

Item	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
1 185 CFM Diesel Air Compressor.	Supplier						
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$65.00	\$165.00	\$450.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$74.00	\$187.00	\$510.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$100.00	\$350.00	\$790.00	
Cashman Equipment Company							
2 5kw Generator.	Supplier						
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$49.00	\$147.00	\$400.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$60.00	\$140.00	\$358.00	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$70.00	\$250.00	\$550.00	
HercRentals							
3 4000 Watt Diesel Generator.	Supplier						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$80.00	\$250.00	\$335.00	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$80.00	\$270.00	\$650.00	
HercRentals							
4 50kw Diesel Generator.	Supplier						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$119.00	\$475.00	\$1,426.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$140.00	\$525.00	\$1,295.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$185.00	\$495.00	\$1,350.00	
HercRentals							
5 Hydraulic Compactor (Backhoe).	Supplier						
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
HercRentals							

6 30" Walk Behind Roller (Padfoot).

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$125.00	\$510.00	\$1,050.00	
HercRentals	1	EA	\$160.00	\$450.00	\$1,300.00	
Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$200.00	\$800.00	\$2,250.00	
Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$220.00	\$800.00	\$1,950.00	

7 DD 25 Roller (or equivalent).

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$175.00	\$510.00	\$1,350.00	
HercRentals	1	EA	\$175.00	\$590.00	\$1,325.00	
Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$175.00	\$630.00	\$1,700.00	
Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$175.00	\$675.00	\$1,600.00	36" Ride On
Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$240.00	\$950.00	\$2,860.00	

8 84" Smooth Drum Soil Compactor.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
HercRentals	1	EA	\$373.00	\$1,150.00	\$3,400.00	
United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$380.00	\$1,285.00	\$3,645.00	
Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$380.00	\$1,350.00	\$3,400.00	CAB, AC
Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$440.00	\$1,760.00	\$5,265.00	
Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$500.00	\$1,600.00	\$4,800.00	

9 84" Pad Foot Soil Compactor.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$380.00	\$1,285.00	\$3,645.00	
Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$425.00	\$1,700.00	\$4,800.00	CAB, AC
Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$440.00	\$1,760.00	\$5,265.00	
Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$550.00	\$1,800.00	\$5,100.00	
HercRentals	1	EA	\$650.00	\$2,000.00	\$5,900.00	

10 20,000 Pound Dozer.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$295.00	\$1,170.00	\$3,500.00	
HercRentals	1	EA	\$376.00	\$1,245.00	\$3,350.00	
Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$425.00	\$1,700.00	\$4,400.00	
Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$439.00	\$1,649.00	\$4,960.00	

11	35,000 Pound Dozer.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$550.00	\$2,065.00	\$6,150.00	CAB, AC, Ripper, 6 way blade
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$550.00	\$2,170.00	\$6,500.00	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$600.00	\$2,200.00	\$6,800.00	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$675.00	\$2,400.00	\$7,200.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$784.00	\$2,647.00	\$6,734.00	

12	40,000 Pound Dozer.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$630.00	\$2,520.00	\$7,560.00	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$675.00	\$2,400.00	\$7,200.00	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$675.00	\$2,600.00	\$7,700.00	CAB, AC, Ripper, 6 way blade
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$965.00	\$2,657.00	\$8,772.00	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$1,000.00	\$2,800.00	\$8,300.00	

13	D8 Dozer with Cab and Rippers. Daily rate.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$1,125.00	\$4,500.00	\$13,500.00	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$1,250.00	\$5,000.00	\$15,000.00	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$1,500.00	\$5,500.00	\$17,000.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$2,000.00	\$5,850.00	\$17,500.00	

14	D10 Dozer with Cab and Rippers.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	\$9,000.00	\$27,000.00	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$1,820.00	\$7,280.00	\$21,840.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$30,000.00	

15	14,000 Pound Backhoe (JD 420 or equivalent).	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$200.00	\$750.00	\$1,750.00	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$200.00	\$800.00	\$2,400.00	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$315.00	\$950.00	\$2,300.00	JD 410 (14,120 lbs) CAB, AC, w/ bucket
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$480.00	\$1,338.00	\$3,150.00	

Item	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
16	44,000 Pound Excavator.						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$366.00	\$1,500.00	\$4,500.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$400.00	\$1,575.00	\$4,800.00	CAB, AC, w/ bucket
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$450.00	\$1,700.00	\$4,500.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$475.00	\$1,800.00	\$4,800.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$566.00	\$1,678.00	\$4,900.00	

Item	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
17	262 Cat Skidsteer with Standard Material Bucket.						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$177.00	\$470.00	\$1,400.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$185.00	\$415.00	\$1,200.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$250.00	\$800.00	\$1,700.00	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$250.00	\$800.00	\$1,900.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$250.00	\$800.00	\$2,250.00	74 HP, tracked

Item	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
18	262 Cat Skidsteer with Breaker Attachment.						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$200.00	\$700.00	\$1,700.00	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$240.00	\$950.00	\$2,850.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$310.00	\$815.00	\$2,105.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$415.00	\$1,425.00	\$3,700.00	550 LB Hammer
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$450.00	\$1,200.00	\$2,400.00	

Item	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
19	262 Cat Skidsteer with Broom Attachment.						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$130.00	\$500.00	\$1,350.00	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$224.00	\$895.00	\$2,685.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$280.00	\$605.00	\$1,625.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$300.00	\$1,050.00	\$2,750.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$450.00	\$1,200.00	\$2,100.00	

Item	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
20	262 Cat Skidsteer with Angle Broom Attachment.						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$125.00	\$500.00	\$1,350.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$280.00	\$605.00	\$1,625.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$450.00	\$1,200.00	\$2,100.00	

21	Hydraulic Compactor (Excavator).	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$200.00	\$700.00	\$1,350.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00	

22	2000 Gallon Water Truck.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$200.00	\$800.00	\$1,900.00	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$200.00	\$800.00	\$1,950.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$326.00	\$1,050.00	\$2,625.00	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$350.00	\$1,225.00	\$2,200.00	Diesel

23	4000 Gallon Water Truck.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$345.00	\$1,395.00	\$3,700.00	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$375.00	\$1,400.00	\$3,400.00	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$425.00	\$1,650.00	\$3,800.00	Diesel
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$525.00	\$1,900.00	\$4,200.00	

24	10,000 Gallon Water Pull.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$850.00	\$3,400.00	\$10,200.00	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$1,900.00	\$4,500.00	\$13,000.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$2,000.00	\$6,300.00	\$18,900.00	

25	Slop Flail Mower.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$4,700.00	\$4,700.00	\$14,000.00	

26	5 Yard Dump Truck.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$175.00	\$700.00	\$1,600.00	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$195.00	\$700.00	\$1,600.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$303.00	\$727.00	\$2,000.00	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$310.00	\$1,240.00	\$3,100.00	Automatic transmission, Gas

27	10 Yard Dump Truck.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$325.00	\$1,300.00	\$3,450.00	Automatic transmission, Gas
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$350.00	\$1,400.00	\$3,600.00	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$425.00	\$1,600.00	\$3,700.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$543.00	\$1,733.00	\$4,600.00	

28	20 Yard End Dump with Tractor.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$300.00	\$900.00	\$3,300.00	

29	12,000 Gallon Stand Tank.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	990	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	\$350.00	\$1,100.00	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$140.00	\$250.00	\$1,100.00	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$150.00	\$450.00	\$1,200.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$600.00	\$600.00	\$1,800.00	

30	7 Ton Pneumatic Roller.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$300.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,825.00	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$350.00	\$1,100.00	\$3,100.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$6,000.00	

31	10 Ton Double Drum AC Roller.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$430.00	\$1,350.00	\$3,700.00	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$600.00	\$2,200.00	\$6,200.00	

32	Self Propelled Asphalt Laydown Machine (18').	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$12,000.00	

33	3 Cubic Yard Rubber Tire Loader.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$306.00	\$1,156.00	\$3,468.00	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$325.00	\$1,300.00	\$3,950.00	3.25 YD, CAB, AC
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$350.00	\$1,400.00	\$3,900.00	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$350.00	\$1,400.00	\$4,200.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$481.00	\$1,437.00	\$4,250.00	
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$495.00	\$1,600.00	\$3,630.00	

34	4 Cubic Yard Rubber Tire Loader.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$450.00	\$1,750.00	\$5,300.00	
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$450.00	\$1,650.00	\$4,700.00	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$495.00	\$1,870.00	\$5,220.00	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$550.00	\$2,000.00	\$5,800.00	4.25 YD, CAB, AC
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$599.00	\$1,900.00	\$4,900.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$607.00	\$1,830.00	\$5,500.00	

35	5 Cubic Yard Rubber Tire Loader.	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
		United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$570.00	\$2,270.00	\$6,800.00	
		Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$603.00	\$2,278.00	\$6,834.00	
		Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$625.00	\$2,300.00	\$6,900.00	5.25 YD, CAB, AC
		Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$800.00	\$2,900.00	\$8,900.00	
		HercRentals	1	EA	\$1,042.00	\$2,869.00	\$8,256.00	

36 14 H Motor Grader.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$630.00	\$2,520.00	\$7,100.00	
Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$675.00	\$2,700.00	\$8,000.00	
United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$699.00	\$2,550.00	\$6,700.00	
Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$700.00	\$2,650.00	\$7,825.00	
Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$1,100.00	\$4,000.00	\$10,500.00	
HercRentals	1	EA	\$2,000.00	\$4,200.00	\$12,500.00	

37 Backhoe with Cab, Extended Hoe, 2 Wheel Drive 7 Four in One Loader Bucket.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$200.00	\$800.00	\$2,400.00	
Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$225.00	\$850.00	\$2,200.00	
United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$230.00	\$690.00	\$1,960.00	
Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$235.00	\$800.00	\$2,100.00	
HercRentals	1	EA	\$242.00	\$727.00	\$1,950.00	

38 10 Wheel 5th Wheel Tractor with Hydraulic Wet Kit.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
HercRentals	1	EA	\$950.00	\$2,700.00	\$7,500.00	

39 Gradall with Tracks or Swamp Tires.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
HercRentals	1	EA	\$2,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$18,000.00	

40 631 Scrapper.

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$1,375.00	\$5,500.00	\$16,500.00	
Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$2,000.00	\$4,700.00	\$13,500.00	
HercRentals	1	EA	\$6,900.00	\$6,900.00	\$20,750.00	

Item	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
41 623 Paddle Wheel Scraper.	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$1,161.00	\$4,644.00	\$13,932.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$6,900.00	\$6,900.00	\$20,750.00	
42 29-30,000 Excavator.	Supplier						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$325.00	\$1,200.00	\$3,120.00	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$325.00	\$1,300.00	\$3,800.00	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$350.00	\$1,250.00	\$3,800.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$375.00	\$1,475.00	\$4,450.00	CAB, AC, w/ bucket
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$465.00	\$1,375.00	\$4,000.00	
43 44-46,000 Excavator.	Supplier						
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$360.00	\$1,500.00	\$4,500.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$425.00	\$1,600.00	\$4,900.00	CAB, AC, w/ bucket
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$450.00	\$1,700.00	\$4,500.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$475.00	\$1,800.00	\$4,800.00	
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$500.00	\$1,900.00	\$5,000.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$566.00	\$1,678.00	\$4,900.00	
44 53-55,000 Excavator.	Supplier						
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$402.00	\$1,605.00	\$4,815.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$495.00	\$1,900.00	\$4,925.00	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$500.00	\$1,800.00	\$4,800.00	
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$500.00	\$1,900.00	\$5,200.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$500.00	\$2,000.00	\$6,000.00	CAB, AC, w/ bucket
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$900.00	\$2,700.00	\$7,500.00	
45 45' Articulated Boom.	Supplier						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$175.00	\$550.00	\$1,550.00	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$175.00	\$600.00	\$1,600.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$200.00	\$550.00	\$1,550.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$225.00	\$750.00	\$1,750.00	4x4, DSL

Item	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Daily	Weekly	Monthly	Supplier Notes
46	80' Boom Diesel 4 Wheel Drive Straight Boom.						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$400.00	\$1,200.00	\$3,800.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$425.00	\$1,800.00	\$4,100.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$495.00	\$1,435.00	\$3,995.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$650.00	\$2,250.00	\$4,550.00	4x4, DSL
47	126' Boom Diesel 4 Wheel Drive Straight Boom.						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$925.00	\$2,650.00	\$7,200.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$950.00	\$4,400.00	\$8,800.00	4x4, DSL
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$1,000.00	\$2,800.00	\$7,800.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$1,177.00	\$3,045.00	\$6,900.00	
48	Track Skidsteer (262 Cat).						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Coastline Equipment (Bragg Investment Company Inc.)	1	EA	\$125.00	\$740.00	\$2,200.00	
	Ahern Rentals, Inc. dba Rhino's Turf Equipment (Ahern Rentals, Inc.)	1	EA	\$225.00	\$700.00	\$1,850.00	80 HP, Track, CAB, AC
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$235.00	\$645.00	\$1,775.00	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$275.00	\$900.00	\$2,500.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$350.00	\$1,050.00	\$2,150.00	
49	Excess Odometer Charges if City Exceeds Mileage. Price per mile charge.						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	HercRentals	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	0	0	0	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$0.25	\$0.25	\$0.25	
50	Refueling Service charge if the City does not return a full Vehicle. Price per gallon.						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	HercRentals	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	0	0	0	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$0.25	\$0.25	\$0.25	
51	Delivery and Pick-up Transportation Charges.						
	Ecco Equipment Corp	1	EA	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	
	HercRentals	1	EA	\$115.00	\$115.00	\$115.00	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$450.00	\$450.00	\$450.00	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$109	\$109	\$109	
	Cashman Equipment Company	1	EA	\$85	\$85	\$85	
	United Rentals (North America), Inc.	1	EA	\$75	\$75	\$75	