

Mayor
John J. Lee

City Manager
Dr. Qiong X. Liu, P.E., PTOE

Council Members
Scott Black
Pamela A. Goynes-Brown
Isaac E. Barron
Richard J. Cherchio



Finance Department

2250 Las Vegas Boulevard, North · Suite 710 · North Las Vegas, Nevada 89030
Telephone: (702) 633-1906 · TDD: (800) 326-6868
www.cityofnorthlasvegas.com

December 11, 2017

CITY OF NORTH LAS VEGAS BID B-1524 ROADWAY PATCHING RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD

Galt Development is recommended for award of this Bid. Respondents have five (5) business days from the date of this notification to submit a protest. Any protest submitted on this recommendation of award must be received in the Office of the City Clerk, 2250 Las Vegas Boulevard, Suite 800, North Las Vegas, NV 89030, no later than December 18, 2017, 12:00 p.m., Pacific Time and be in accordance with the following protest procedure:

BID PROTESTS: The City will publish the Recommendation of Award Notification on the City of North Las Vegas' website (www.cityofnorthlasvegas.com). Any Respondent may file a notice of protest regarding the proposed award of a contract by the North Las Vegas City Council. *Respondents will have five (5) business days from the date the Recommendation of Award is published to submit the written protest to the City Clerk.* The written protest must include a statement setting forth, with specificity, the reasons the person filing the protest believes that applicable provisions of the contract documents or law were violated. At the time a notice of protest is filed, the person filing such notice of protest shall post a bond with a good and solvent surety authorized to do business in the State of Nevada, and supply it to the City Clerk. *The bond posted must be in an amount equal to the lesser of: twenty-five (25) percent of the total value of the bid submitted by the person filing the notice of protest; or two hundred fifty thousand dollars (\$250,000).*

A notice of protest filed in accordance with this section shall operate as a stay of action in relation to the award of the contract until a determination is made by the North Las Vegas City Council. A person who makes an unsuccessful bid may not seek any type of judicial intervention until after the North Las Vegas City Council has made a determination on the notice of protest and awarded the contract. Neither the City nor any authorized representative of the City is liable for any costs, expenses, attorney's fees, loss of income or other damages sustained by a person who submits a bid, whether or not the person files a notice of protest pursuant to this section.

If a protest is upheld, the bond posted and submitted with the notice of protest will be returned to the person who posted the bond. If the protest is rejected, a claim may be made against the bond by the City in an amount equal to the expenses incurred by the City because of the unsuccessful protest.

A handwritten signature in blue ink, appearing to read 'Paul Sikora', is written over a horizontal line.

Paul Sikora
Contracts Coordinator

1 Cost per 2 inch or less thick patch (Not including County Permit Fees)							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
Galt Development	1	Per Square	\$5.50	\$5.50			
J and J Enterprise Services, Inc.	1	Per Square	\$9.74	\$9.74			
American Pavement Preservation llc	1	Per Square	\$14.14	\$14.14			
foxy construction llc	1	Per Square	\$28.25	\$28.25			
2 Cost per 2 and 1/4 inch to 4 inch thick patch (Not including Clark County Permit Fees)							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
Galt Development	1	Per Square	\$8.61	\$8.61			
J and J Enterprise Services, Inc.	1	Per Square	\$12.82	\$12.82			
American Pavement Preservation llc	1	Per Square	\$14.69	\$14.69			
foxy construction llc	1	Per Square	\$52.60	\$52.60			
3 Cost per 4 and 1/4 inch to 6 inch thick patch (Not including Clark County Permit Fees)							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
Galt Development	1	Per Square	\$9.50	\$9.50			
J and J Enterprise Services, Inc.	1	Per Square	\$16.37	\$16.37			
American Pavement Preservation llc	1	Per Square	\$16.89	\$16.89			
foxy construction llc	1	Per Square	\$66.25	\$66.25			
4 Cost for 6 inch or greater thick patch (excluding permit fees)							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
foxy construction llc	1	EA	No Bid				
Galt Development	1	EA	\$9.50	\$9.50			
J and J Enterprise Services, Inc.	1	EA	\$21.44	\$21.44			
American Pavement Preservation llc	1	EA	\$34.29	\$34.29	\$34.29 this should be UOM SF not Each per Pre Bid		
5 Cost for manhole collaring removal							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
foxy construction llc	1	EA	No Bid				
Galt Development	1	EA	\$150.00	\$150.00			
J and J Enterprise Services, Inc.	1	EA	\$391.05	\$391.05			
American Pavement Preservation llc	1	EA	\$560.00	\$560.00			
6 Cost for manhole collaring replacement							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
foxy construction llc	1	EA	No Bid				
Galt Development	1	EA	\$150.00	\$150.00			
J and J Enterprise Services, Inc.	1	EA	\$391.05	\$391.05			
American Pavement Preservation llc	1	EA	\$1,067.00	\$1,067.00			
7 Cost for Water valve Removal							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
foxy construction llc	1	EA	No Bid				
Galt Development	1	EA	\$150.00	\$150.00			
J and J Enterprise Services, Inc.	1	EA	\$203.68	\$203.68			
American Pavement Preservation llc	1	EA	\$560.00	\$560.00			
8 Cost for Water valve Replacement							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Unit Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manuf Num
foxy construction llc	1	EA	No Bid				
Galt Development	1	EA	\$150.00	\$150.00			
J and J Enterprise Services, Inc.	1	EA	\$203.68	\$203.68			
American Pavement Preservation llc	1	EA	\$858.00	\$858.00			